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From: Abramoff, Jack (Dir-DC-Gov) g . behalf

of Abramoff, Jack (Dir-DC-Gov)

Sent: ‘ Monday, September 30, 2002 4:49 PM

To: Bozniak, Allison R. (AdmAst-DC-Gov/Adm)
Subject: RE: Retainer payment for Julie Doolittle
Thanks.

~——Original Message—

From: Bozniak, Allison R. (AdmAst-DC-Gov/Adm)
Sent: Monday, September 30, 2002 5:15 PM

To: Abramoff, Jack (Dir-DC-Gov)

Subject: Retainer payment for Julie Doolittle

We submit for payment out of the Agua Caliente retainer. $5,000 a month.
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